SM&C WG Telecon #43 – Minutes of Meeting

Date: 31 July 2007, 17:00 CET

Issue: 1.0

Participants:

	Present?
	Initials
	Name
	WG
	Organisation

	
	BH
	Brendan Harnett 
	SM&C
	BNSC

	
	BB
	Brigitte Behal
	SM&C
	CNES

	Yes
	EP
	Erwan Poupart
	SM&C
	CNES

	
	PM
	Philip Melanson
	SM&C
	CSA

	Yes
	HH
	Harald Hofmann
	SM&C
	DLR

	
	AE
	Alessandro Ercolani
	SM&C
	ESA

	Yes
	MM
	Mario Merri
	SM&C
	ESA

	
	MS
	Michael Schmidt
	SM&C
	ESA

	
	NP
	Nestor Peccia
	MOIMS
	ESA

	
	ID
	Ivan Dankiewicz
	SM&C
	ESA/SciSys

	Yes
	SC
	Sam Cooper
	SM&C
	ESA/SciSys

	Yes
	RT
	Roger Thompson
	SM&C
	ESA/SciSys, BNSC

	Yes
	KR
	Kevin Rice
	
	GST

	
	BK
	Brad Kizzot
	OMG
	Harris

	
	GS
	Gerry Simon
	
	Integral Systems

	
	TY
	Takairo Yamada
	SM&C
	Jaxa

	
	GC
	Geraldine Chaudhri
	
	NASA/Aerospace Corporation

	
	CF
	Curtis Fatig
	
	NASA/Goddard

	Yes
	DS
	Dan Smith
	
	NASA/Goddard

	
	RJ
	Ron Jones
	
	NASA/Goddard

	
	LH
	Leerha Herrera
	
	NASA/Johns Hopkins University

	
	AO
	Amalaye Oyake
	SM&C
	NASA/JPL

	
	PS
	Peter Shames
	SM&C
	NASA/JPL

	
	SB
	Stephen Beisert
	
	NASA/JSC

	
	GV
	Gert Villemos 
	
	Terma

	Yes
	GK
	Gary Knickerbocker
	
	NASA/Marshall


1 Approval of agenda and MoM of Telecon#42
MM welcomed all participants and asked if everyone agreed with the proposed agenda that was distributed, that is:

1. Approval of agenda and MoM of Telecon#42

2. Review of actions

3. Review of SM&C Common Service RIDs

4. Review of SM&C Core Service RIDs

5. Report on XTCE status

6. AOB

Everyone agreed with the above agenda.

The minutes of Telecon#42 were approved with no change.

2 Review of actions
	ID
	Action
	Start
	Due
	Actionee
	Status
	Notes

	070119-01
	KR to come up with a plan for updating the XTCE MB. Due 31 May 07
	19 Jan 07
	31 May 07
	KR
	OPEN
	


3 Review of SM&C Common Service RIDs
The following RID was flagged “to-be-discussed” by SC and the following disposition was agreed during the telecom:
· RID 145: Withdrawn by the author.
The following RIDs were discussed on request of the telecom participants:

· RID 131 (EP): It was agreed to add the version to the service directory.
· EP raised the issue of security. It was agreed that SC will highlight in an email to MM areas in the documents (MAL, Common, Core) where security needs to be checked. MM will ask for comments to D. Fischer of the CCSDS Security WG.
Detailed description of the agreed RID resolutions can be found in the online RID database.

SC confirmed that he will update the book with the agreed disposition by the 6-Aug-07 (original date was 4-Aug-07, but this is a Saturday). It was also agreed that there is no need for the WG to check the proper implementation of the RID dispositions and that MM could initiate the Agency Review process with the submission to CESG.
4 Review of SM&C Core Service RIDs
The following RIDs were flagged “to-be-discussed” by SC and the following disposition was agreed during the telecom:

· RID 87: accepted – TC progress reporting will be added.
· RID 155: accepted – accepted this as a generic operation.
· RID 163: accepted - both approaches are supported by the SM&C: European prefers to have parametrised alerts, while NASA mainly uses text string alerts. In case of interoperability, a message converter should be in place. A comment will be added to clarify this.
The following RIDs were discussed on request of the telecom participants:

· RID 88 and 89 (SC): The solution proposed by SC is agreed. It is acknowledge that no chance has been given to BB to confirm this point as she is currently on leave. In any case, it was agreed to proceed with the update as BB will always be able to raise an official RID during the formal review.
Detailed description of the agreed RID resolutions can be found in the online RID database.

SC confirmed that he will update the book with the agreed disposition by the 6-Aug-07 (original date was 4-Aug-07, but this is a Saturday). It was also agreed that there is no need for the WG to check the proper implementation of the RID dispositions and that MM could initiate the Agency Review process with the submission to CESG.
5 Report on XTCE status
MM reported that the only missing step for the adoption by CCSDS of XTCE is the availability of a report on the prototyping exercise. Unfortunately, the prototypes developed by both ESA and NASA were based on pre-final versions of XTCE and required some modifications to properly work. Additionally, confidentiality issues prevented the exchange of the operational databases (JWST from NASA and Cryosat-1 from ESA). The current status is that the prototypes have been corrected on both sides and the confidentiality issues have been overcome. KR confirmed that he will be able to produce a draft report by the 6-Aug-07.
HH expressed an interest on the side of DLR to use XTCE for one of their future missions, Tamdem-X. MM reported that the “1st XTCE Users Workshop” is being organised by KR and will take place on the 2-Oct-07 in the same location where the CCSDS workshop will take place. The purpose of the workshop is to bring together current and potential users of XTCE to exchange experience and highlight future needs. The workshop will be in parallel to the CCSDS SM&C WG session. MM suggested to HH to make sure that some one in his team will attend the workshop to collect the initial information.
6 AOB

6.1 Next Telecon

The next telecon will be on 18 Sep 2007 at 17:00 CET. The main topics will be

· the status of RID on MAL (although due date for RIDs is 21-Sep-07)
· Preparation of the next CCSDS workshop.
6.2 Schedule

The following tables provide a snapshot of the WG milestones. It has been already updated with the changes agreed above on the new charter. In bold any variation from the previous version (in brackets the original status).

GOAL 1 (GB)

	Date
	Milestone

	5 Nov 03
	Telecon#03: status report

	3 Dec 03
	Telecon#04: status report

	5 Jan 04
	White Book – draft 0.1

	28 Jan 04
	Telecon#05: Review

	18 Feb 04
	White Book – draft 0.2

	3 Mar 04
	Telecon#06: status report

	28 May 04
	White Book – draft 0.5

	4 Jun 04
	Telecon: agreement on WB draft 0.5

	26 Aug 04
	Deadline for comments to WB after 3-month informal agency review

	2 Sep 04
	Telecon: agreement on comment disposition

	23 Sep 04
	Submission of WB to CCSDS as proposed GB

	4 April 05
	Updated GB (integrating changes from CCSDS review) available

	15 April 05
	Submission of SM&C GB 1.0 to CCSDS for approval

	May 05
	Published GB issue 1.0

	03 Oct 05
	Internal  responses to NASA issues on GB available

	12 Oct 05
	Telecon#18: Internal discussion on responses to NASA issues on GB

	24 Oct 05
	Agreed responses to  NASA issues back to CESB with proposed GB ToC

	28 Nov 05
	GB draft 1.1 available

	12 Dec 05
	Comments due to GB draft 1.1

	20 Dec 05
	Telecon#23: agreement on new SM&C GB and disposition of RIDs from 1st Internal Agency Review of the 3 HP RBs

	20 Jan 06
	Comments due to GB Issue 2: Draft B

	14 Feb 06
	Submission of GB 2.0 to CCSDS for approval

	14 Sep 06
	GB 2.0 approved (confirmation by DLR)


GOAL 2a (High Priority (HP) RBs)

	Date
	Milestone

	14 Jul 04
	Delivery of concept paper

	21 Jul 04
	Telecon#11: agreement on concept paper

	15 Oct 04
	Delivery of 3 HP RBs draft 0.1

	27 Oct 04
	Telecon#13: Discussion 2 HP RBs draft 0.1

	14 Jan 05
	Delivery of 3 HP RBs draft 0.2

	26 Jan 05
	Telecon#14: discussion on 3 HP RBs drafts 0.2

	16 Mar 05
	Telecon#15: discussion on general status

	4 Apr 05
	Delivery of 3 HP RBs draft 0.3

	6 Jun 05
	Availability of TN on feasibility of AMS for SM&C

	15 Jun 05
	Telecon#16: discussion on 5 RBs + prototype approach + AMS

	20 Jul 05
	Telecon#17: discussion on 3 HP RBs

	31 Aug 05
	Delivery of 3 HP RBs draft 0.4

	7 Jan 06
	Comments of 1st internal Agency review of 3 HP RBs draft 0.4 due

	26 Jan 06
	· Response to comments of 1st review due

· Comments on new 3 HP RBs (Protocol 0.7, Common 0.4, Core 0.5) due

	31 Jan 06
	Telecon#25:

· Prototype kick off

· Discussion on the comments of the 3 HP RBs following internal Agency review

· Discussion on the comments of the new versions of the 3 HP RBs

	21 Feb 06
	Telecon#26:

· Prototype kick off

· Discussion on the comments of the 3 HP RBs

	20 Mar 06
	Telecon#28:

· Discussion on the comments of the 3 HP RBs from NASA and JPL

· Discussion on the TN on the prototype.

	31 Mar 06
	Delivery of prototype components:

· SM&C Protocol C API (AO/JPL)

· Common Java API (ID/SC/SciSys)

· Core Java API (BH/Logica)

	26 Apr 06
	Telecon#29:

· Discussion on the comments of the 3 HP RBs from NASA and JPL

· Report on status of the TN on the prototype

· Agenda for CCSDS workshop

	24 May 06
	Telecon#31:

· Discussion on the comments of the 3 HP RBs from NASA and JPL

· Report on prototype status

· Agenda for CCSDS workshop

	Winter WS 07
	Delivery of new issue of 2 HP RBs (review + prototype feedback)

	18-Feb-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Internal SM&C review: Start

	17-Apr-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Internal SM&C review: Telecon#41

	19-Apr-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Internal SM&C review: RID due

	26-Apr-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Internal SM&C review: RID response due

	2-May-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Internal SM&C review: Review (Telecon#42)

	06-May-07
	Common & Core Services - Internal SM&C review: Start

	1-Jun-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Internal SM&C review: updated book available

	04-Jun-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - CESG review: Start

	03-Jul-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - CESG review: RID due

	05-Jul-07
	Common & Core Services - Internal SM&C review: RID due

	23-Jul-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - CESG review: updated book available

	23-Jul-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Agency review: Start

	31-Jul-07
	Common & Core Services - Internal SM&C review: Review (Telecon#43)

	06-Aug-07
	Common & Core Services - Internal SM&C review: updated book available

	19-Aug-07
	Common & Core Services - CESG review: Start

	15-Dec-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Agency review: updated book available

	18-Sep-07
	Common & Core Services - CESG review: RID due

	18-Oct-07
	Common & Core Services - CESG review: updated book available

	02-Nov-07
	Common & Core Services - Agency review: Start

	15-Nov-07
	SM&C Messaging Abstraction Layer - Agency review: RID due

	31-Jan-08
	Common & Core Services - Agency review: RID due

	01-Mar-08
	Common & Core Services - Agency review: updated book available


GOAL 2b (Prototype)

	Date
	Milestone

	31 May 05
	Prototype Concept Paper available

	31 Oct 05
	Delivery of prototype SoW draft 0.1 (MM)

	1 Mar 06
	Start prototype work (estimated duration 6m)

	1 Jun 06
	Some co-working component of prototype available

	15 Jun 06
	Preliminary prototype demonstration @ CCSDS workshop

	14 Sep 06
	Telecon#36 to check status of prototype

	17 Oct 06
	Telecon#37 to check status of prototype

	21 Nov 06
	Telecon#39 to check status of prototype

	11 Dec 06
	Telecon#40 to check status of prototype

	Fall WS 07
	Final prototype demonstration @ CCSDS workshop


GOAL 3 (XTCE Review)
	Date
	Milestone

	15 Feb 05
	Submission of XTCE review datapackage to CCSDS Secretariat for initiation of the Public Review

	11-15 Apr 05 
	Disposition of XTCE RIDs

	12 Oct 05
	JMu to draft and distribute XTCE MB ToC with highlights of the content of each chapter

	14 Oct 05
	CF+KR draft and distribute XTCE GB ToC with highlights of the content of each chapter

	19 Oct 05
	Telecon#19 to discuss comments and Kick off work (5pm CET)

	02 Nov 05
	CF+KR+RJ+JMu+JMo distribute XTCE GB draft 0.1

	08 Nov 05
	Telecon#20 to discuss XTCE GB draft 0.1 (5pm CET)

	16 Nov 05
	CF+KR+RJ+JMu+JMo distribute XTCE GB draft 0.2

	22 Nov 05
	Telecon#21 to discuss XTCE GB draft 0.2 (5pm CET)

	30 Nov 05
	CF+KR+RJ+JMu+JMo distribute XTCE GB issue 1.0

	12 Dec 05
	CF+KR+RJ+JMu+JMo distribute XTCE MB draft 0.2

	14 Dec 05
	Telecon#22 to discuss XTCE MB draft 0.2 and decision on sending XTCE GB to CESG (5pm CET)

	16 Jan 06
	CF+KR+RJ+JMu+JMo distribute XTCE MB draft 0.3

	19 Jan 06
	Telecon#24 to discuss XTCE MB draft 0.3 (5pm CET)

	27 Jan 06
	RJ to send to MM the updated XTCE GB (draft 1.1) + comments/responses matrix

	30 Jan 06
	MM to submit XTCE GB (draft 1.1) + comments/responses matrix to CESG via AD

	15 Feb 06
	CF+KR+RJ+JMu+JMo distribute XTCE MB issue 1.0.

	22 Feb 06
	Telecon#27 to discuss XTCE MB 1.0 and approach to its validation

	20 Mar 06
	End of 2nd CCSDS Agency review (start 01 Dec 05)

	19 May 06
	Telecon#30 to discuss RIDs (first set)

	31 May 06
	Full set of RIDs responses available

	01 Jun 06
	Telecon#32 to discuss RIDs

	06 Jul 06
	Telecon#33 to discuss RIDs (full set)

	24 Jul 06
	Telecon#34 to check status of XTCE update

	25 Aug 06
	Telecon#35 to check status of XTCE update

	28 Aug 06
	Updated XTCE specification (XTCE 1.1 final) ready

	04 Sep 06
	Submission of XTCE 1.1 final to OMG (3 week rule)

	19 Oct 06
	Telecon#38 to check status of XTCE

	10 Nov 06
	Submission of XTCE 1.1 final to OMG (3 week rule)

	04 Dec 06
	Approval of XTCE 1.1 final by OMG at Washington DC meeting (04-08 Dec 06)

	28 Feb 07
	Delivery of XTCE 1.1 final to CESB for approval as BB

	01 Jun 07
	Delivery of XTCE MB to CESB for approval


GOAL 4 (Other SM&C Services)

	Date
	Milestone

	04 Apr 05
	New drafts of the RBs as follows:

· SM&C Time Service

· SM&C Remote Software Management Service

	01 Sep 05
	Availability of revised versions of

· SM&C Time Service

· SM&C Remote Software Management Service

· SM&C Automation Service (NEW)

	Spring WS 06
	Availability of the consolidated RBs for

· SM&C Time Service

· SM&C Remote Software Management Service

· SM&C Automation Service

	4 Dec 06
	Availability of the WB on Planning and Automation services

	Fall WS 07 (tentative)
	Availability of the WBs for

· SM&C Time Service

· SM&C Remote Software Management Service

· SM&C Automation Service


7 Summary of Open Actions

	ID
	Action
	Start
	Due
	Actionee
	Status
	Notes

	070119-01
	KR to come up with a plan for updating the XTCE MB. Due 31 May 07
	19 Jan 07
	31 May 07
	KR
	OPEN
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